
Community Calendar

Monday, July 1, 2024

Canada Day Celebrations at Alder Street Recreation Centre

Date and Time: Monday, July 1 11:45 am - 5:00 pm

Address: Alder Street Recreation Centre, 275 Alder Street, Orangeville, ON

Enjoy a community celebration of Canada Day on July 1 at the Alder Street Recreation Centre. This free family
-friendly event includes a special opening ceremony, free swim sessions, high-energy and interactive concerts w
ith TEAM T&J’s Kids Jumpin’ Jamboree, and a family fun zone with inflatables, rock climbing wall and mega 
obstacle course. There will also be face painting and airbrush tattoos, Neighbourhood Block Box crafts, and act
ivities hosted by the Orangeville Public Library. Food services will be provided by B Social Café. Canada Day e
ntertainment continues into the evening with at fireworks show at Island Lake Conservation Area  at 10 p.m.

Canada Day Fireworks

Date and Time: Monday, July 1 10:00 pm

Address: Island Lake Conservation Area, 673067 Hurontario St, Orangeville, ON

Celebrate Canada Day with fireworks over Island Lake Conservation Area. Entry to the park is free after 9 p.m.,
and attendees are encouraged to bring both lawn chairs and blankets for seating.

Wednesday, July 3, 2024

Cruisin’ on First Classic & Custom Car Show

Date and Time: Wednesday, July 3 6:00 pm - 8:30 pm

Address: 99 First Street, Orangeville, ON

The family friendly cruise nights, features classic cars and trucks as well as custom rides on display at the Cana
dian Tire parking lot in Orangeville. The show takes place every Wednesday night until September 25, and there 
is no fee to attend. Weather permitting. 

Friday, July 5, 2024

Great Canadian Wrestling Live

Date and Time: Friday, July 5 6:30 pm - 9:00 pm



Address: Orangeville Curling Club, 76 Fifth Avenue, Orangeville, ON

Come and enjoy a Great Canadian Wrestling Live event in Orangeville hosted by POP Culture Canada. The eve
nt will feature wrestling superstars from all over Ontario as well as vendors selling t-shirts, photos, and even au
thentic Lucha wrestling masks! Attendees will also have the opportunity to meet their favourite superstars durin
g intermission. Adult general admission is $15 in advance or $20 at the door. Tickets for children 12 and under 
are $10 in advance or $15 at the door (general admission). Advance tickets can be purchased online.

Orangeville Jr A Northmen vs Six Nations Arrows

Date and Time: Friday, July 5 8:00 pm

Address: Tony Rose Memorial Sports Centre, 6 Northmen Way, Orangeville

Jr A Northmen Home Game at Tony Rose Memorial Sports Centre. 

Cost of Entry:
$10.00/Adult
$5.00/Student or Senior

Saturday, July 6, 2024

Orangeville Farmers' Market

Date and Time: Saturday, July 6 8:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: Beside Town Hall - 87 Broadway, Orangeville, ON

The Orangeville Farmers' Market offers the best in fresh produce, fruits, locally raised meats, fish, flowers, ho
me baked goods and unique artisan crafts. Located directly beside Town Hall on Second Street, the market featu
res free weekly draws, live entertainment, special events, and activities for children.Visit downtownorangeville.
ca for a list of participating vendors each week. The market runs every Saturday until October 19, 2024.

Family Fun Festival

Date and Time: Saturday, July 6 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: Orangeville Fairgrounds, 247090 5th Sideroad, Mono, ON

The second annual Family Fun Fest offers activies for all ages including an exotic reptile presentation, pony rid
es, inflatable obstacle course, a petting zoo, food trucks, live music, face painting and a vendor market.  Tickets
be purchased online in advance, with part of the proceeds supporting the Orangeville Food Bank.       

Orangeville Fiddle & Stepdance Contest

Date and Time: Saturday, July 6 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: Westminster United Church, 247 Broadway, Orangeville, ON



Contestants from across Ontario are coming to Orangeville to showcase their talents at the Orangeville Fiddle 
& Stepdance Contest on Saturday, July 6! There will be a full day of entertaining live performances for all ages,
showcasing this high-energy style of music and dance from the Ottawa Valley that combines Celtic and French i
nfluences with old time Canadian tradition. Contestants will perform a variety of waltzes, clogs, jigs, and reels 
in age divisions from nine years old and under to 50 years old and over. Tickets will be available for purchase at
the door ($15 for adults, $10 for seniors, $5 for children and family/group rates available). 

Wednesday, July 10, 2024

Cruisin’ on First Classic & Custom Car Show

Date and Time: Wednesday, July 10 6:00 pm - 8:30 pm

Address: 99 First Street, Orangeville, ON

The family friendly cruise nights, features classic cars and trucks as well as custom rides on display at the Cana
dian Tire parking lot in Orangeville. The show takes place every Wednesday night until September 25, and there 
is no fee to attend. Weather permitting. 

Orangeville Jr A Northmen vs Brampton Excelsiors

Date and Time: Wednesday, July 10 8:00 pm

Address: Tony Rose Memorial Sports Centre, 6 Northmen Way, Orangeville

Jr A Northmen Home Game at Tony Rose Memorial Sports Centre. 

Cost of Entry:
$10.00/Adult
$5.00/Student or Senior

Saturday, July 13, 2024

14th Annual Bass Fishing Derby at Island Lake CA

Date and Time: Saturday, July 13 7:00 am - 3:00 pm

Address: Island Lake Conservation Area, 673067 Hurontario St, Orangeville, ON, L9W 1Z1

Come Fishing!

Join Credit Valley Conservation, Credit Valley Conservation Foundation and the Friends of Island Lake for the 
14th Annual Island Lake Bass Derby.

Big catch prizes are available for the top 10 bass! Prizes are also available for perch, crappie, pike and youth cat
egories.



14th Annual Bass Fishing Derby at Island Lake CA

Date and Time: Saturday, July 13 7:00 am - 3:00 pm

Address: Island Lake Conservation Area, 673067 Hurontario St Orangeville, ON

Twice a year, fishing derbies are held at Island Lake. Enthusiasts can bait their hooks and join the competition. 
More information and registration available here.

Orangeville Farmers' Market

Date and Time: Saturday, July 13 8:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: Beside Town Hall - 87 Broadway, Orangeville, ON

The Orangeville Farmers' Market offers the best in fresh produce, fruits, locally raised meats, fish, flowers, ho
me baked goods and unique artisan crafts. Located directly beside Town Hall on Second Street, the market featu
res free weekly draws, live entertainment, special events, and activities for children.Visit downtownorangeville.
ca for a list of participating vendors each week. The market runs every Saturday until October 19, 2024.

Sunday, July 14, 2024

14th Annual Bass Fishing Derby at Island Lake CA

Date and Time: Sunday, July 14 7:00 am - 3:00 pm

Address: Island Lake Conservation Area, 673067 Hurontario St, Orangeville, ON, L9W 1Z1

Come Fishing!

Join Credit Valley Conservation, Credit Valley Conservation Foundation and the Friends of Island Lake for the 
14th Annual Island Lake Bass Derby.

Big catch prizes are available for the top 10 bass! Prizes are also available for perch, crappie, pike and youth cat
egories.

14th Annual Bass Fishing Derby at Island Lake CA

Date and Time: Sunday, July 14 7:00 am - 3:00 pm

Address: Island Lake Conservation Area, 673067 Hurontario St Orangeville, ON

Twice a year, fishing derbies are held at Island Lake. Enthusiasts can bait their hooks and join the competition. 
More information and registration available here.



TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Sunday, July 14 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 
turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Wednesday, July 17, 2024

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Wednesday, July 17 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 



turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Cruisin’ on First Classic & Custom Car Show

Date and Time: Wednesday, July 17 6:00 pm - 8:30 pm

Address: 99 First Street, Orangeville, ON

The family friendly cruise nights, features classic cars and trucks as well as custom rides on display at the Cana
dian Tire parking lot in Orangeville. The show takes place every Wednesday night until September 25, and there 
is no fee to attend. Weather permitting. 

Thursday, July 18, 2024

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Thursday, July 18 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 



turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Friday, July 19, 2024

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Friday, July 19 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 
turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins



piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Orangeville Rotary Ribfest

Date and Time: Friday, July 19 4:00 pm - 10:00 pm

Address: Alder Street Recreation Centre, 275 Alder St, Orangeville, ON

The 15th annual Orangeville Rotary Ribfest summer festival serves up mouth-watering barbecued ribs for a go
od cause. This year's event will feature six ribbers, a food truck festival, live music, and family-friendly entertai
nment. Find a full schedule of events at www.orangevilleribfest.com.

Saturday, July 20, 2024

Orangeville Farmers' Market

Date and Time: Saturday, July 20 8:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: Beside Town Hall - 87 Broadway, Orangeville, ON

The Orangeville Farmers' Market offers the best in fresh produce, fruits, locally raised meats, fish, flowers, ho
me baked goods and unique artisan crafts. Located directly beside Town Hall on Second Street, the market featu
res free weekly draws, live entertainment, special events, and activities for children.Visit downtownorangeville.
ca for a list of participating vendors each week. The market runs every Saturday until October 19, 2024.

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Saturday, July 20 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 



turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Orangeville Rotary Ribfest

Date and Time: Saturday, July 20 11:00 am - 10:00 pm

Address: Alder Street Recreation Centre, 275 Alder St, Orangeville, ON

The 15th annual Orangeville Rotary Ribfest summer festival serves up mouth-watering barbecued ribs for a go
od cause. This year's event will feature six ribbers, a food truck festival, live music, and family-friendly entertai
nment. Find a full schedule of events at www.orangevilleribfest.com.

Sunday, July 21, 2024

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Sunday, July 21 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 



turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Orangeville Rotary Ribfest

Date and Time: Sunday, July 21 11:00 am - 7:00 pm

Address: Alder Street Recreation Centre, 275 Alder St, Orangeville, ON

The 15th annual Orangeville Rotary Ribfest summer festival serves up mouth-watering barbecued ribs for a go
od cause. This year's event will feature six ribbers, a food truck festival, live music, and family-friendly entertai
nment. Find a full schedule of events at www.orangevilleribfest.com.

Wednesday, July 24, 2024

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Wednesday, July 24 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 



turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Cruisin’ on First Classic & Custom Car Show

Date and Time: Wednesday, July 24 6:00 pm - 8:30 pm

Address: 99 First Street, Orangeville, ON

The family friendly cruise nights, features classic cars and trucks as well as custom rides on display at the Cana
dian Tire parking lot in Orangeville. The show takes place every Wednesday night until September 25, and there 
is no fee to attend. Weather permitting. 

Thursday, July 25, 2024

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Thursday, July 25 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 



turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Cancer Support Group

Date and Time: Thursday, July 25 1:00 pm - 2:00 pm

Address: 346255 15 Sideroad

This peer-led cancer support group welcomes patients, survivors, caregivers, and support people gather for fell
owship and support.

No cost. Anyone can attend at any time.

This support group meets monthly, usually on the last Thursday of each month at 1:00PM. 

Location: High Country United Church (346255 Side Road 15 in Mono)

For more information call 519-941-0972, email highcountryunited@gmail.com or visit www.highcountryunit
ed.weebly.com 

Friday, July 26, 2024

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Friday, July 26 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

mailto:highcountryunited@gmail.com
https://www.highcountryunited.weebly.com


Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 
turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Mean Girls: High School Version

Date and Time: Friday, July 26 7:30 pm

Address: 87 Broadway, Orangeville, ON

Theatre Orangeville - Young Company presents a stage version of Mean Girls with your favourite characters fr
om the movie, powerful music, and timely pop cultures and news references. Recommended for 12+ viewers. T
ickets available here.

Saturday, July 27, 2024

Orangeville Farmers' Market

Date and Time: Saturday, July 27 8:00 am - 1:00 pm



Address: Beside Town Hall - 87 Broadway, Orangeville, ON

The Orangeville Farmers' Market offers the best in fresh produce, fruits, locally raised meats, fish, flowers, ho
me baked goods and unique artisan crafts. Located directly beside Town Hall on Second Street, the market featu
res free weekly draws, live entertainment, special events, and activities for children.Visit downtownorangeville.
ca for a list of participating vendors each week. The market runs every Saturday until October 19, 2024.

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Saturday, July 27 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 
turner.

 

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

The Mom Market

Date and Time: Saturday, July 27 10:00 am - 3:00 pm

Address: Orangeville Curling Club, 76 Fifth Avenue, Orangeville, ON



Get ready to get your shop on! Bringing Dufferin County, family friendly pop-up markets featuring the best of l
ocal artisans, makers and creatives! Get more details here.

Summer Sounds - Live on Broadway

Date and Time: Saturday, July 27 11:00 am - 3:00 pm

Address: 87 Broadway, Orangeville, ON

Summer Sounds - Live on Broadway will celebrate local musical talent every Saturday from July 20 to August 
31 in three locations. Check Downtown Orangeville BIA website for artist schedule and locations.

Mean Girls: High School Version

Date and Time: Saturday, July 27 2:00 pm

Address: 87 Broadway, Orangeville, ON

Theatre Orangeville - Young Company presents a stage version of Mean Girls with your favourite characters fr
om the movie, powerful music, and timely pop cultures and news references. Recommended for 12+ viewers. T
ickets available here.

Mean Girls: High School Version

Date and Time: Saturday, July 27 7:30 pm

Address: 87 Broadway, Orangeville, ON

Theatre Orangeville - Young Company presents a stage version of Mean Girls with your favourite characters fr
om the movie, powerful music, and timely pop cultures and news references. Recommended for 12+ viewers. T
ickets available here.

Sunday, July 28, 2024

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Sunday, July 28 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 
turner.

 



Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Mean Girls: High School Version

Date and Time: Sunday, July 28 2:00 pm

Address: 87 Broadway, Orangeville, ON

Theatre Orangeville - Young Company presents a stage version of Mean Girls with your favourite characters fr
om the movie, powerful music, and timely pop cultures and news references. Recommended for 12+ viewers. T
ickets available here.

Wednesday, July 31, 2024

TRILOGY 2024 – At the Headwaters Arts Gallery in the Alton Mills Arts Centre

Date and Time: Wednesday, July 31 10:00 am - 5:00 pm

Address: 1402 Queen Street, Suite 100, Alton Village, Caledon, ON L7K 0C3

 

Kathryn Thomson, Glass artist at Glasscraft in Orangeville, and the Headwaters Arts Gallery proudly presents, “
Trilogy”, a dynamite members art show featuring over 90 works by three extraordinary and extremely talented 
Headwaters Arts members, Marnie Cooke, painter; Kathryn Thomson, glass artist and Lawrence Kristan, wood 
turner.

 



https://calendar.orangeville.ca

Each artist shares their special method of working with their chosen medium.

 

Kathryn Thompson is a glass blower who creates ethereal bowls and vases and also uses the technique of sandblasting to create stories on these and her mor

e sculptural pieces.

Marnie Cooke, a contemporary interpretive artist, paints using acrylics, in a bright, colourful and interpretive, impressionistic style using nature as her main ins

piration.

Lawrence Kristan turns wood, creating beautiful organic feeling vases and bowls using native wood such as spalted or silver maple and box alder, among oth

ers.

Says Kathryn Thompson, “The juxtaposition of these three very different mediums is sure to excite the viewer as they experience the unique yet complimenta

ry works of art displaying light, colour, and texture of paint, glass and wood.”

Marnie adds, “This show captures all the qualities of light, colour and technique then juxtaposes three very different mediums that complement each other bea

utifully.”

This show promises to present all things beautiful, which will most certainly bring enjoyment and intrigue to all those who visit the show. Not to be missed! 

The show is running at the Alton Mill Arts Centre from Saturday, July 6th until August 5th, 2024. 

Cruisin’ on First Classic & Custom Car Show

Date and Time: Wednesday, July 31 6:00 pm - 8:30 pm

Address: 99 First Street, Orangeville, ON

The family friendly cruise nights, features classic cars and trucks as well as custom rides on display at the Cana
dian Tire parking lot in Orangeville. The show takes place every Wednesday night until September 25, and there 
is no fee to attend. Weather permitting. 

https://calendar.orangeville.ca

